
Birds are great!
From the nine-foot-tall ostriches of the 
savanna to the tiny Bee Hummingbird of 
Cuba, birds are wonderfully diverse.

They can be bright blue, emerald green, and 
stunning yellow. Albatrosses have enormous 
wings for gliding over remote oceans. Quail 
have tufts of feathers on their heads that bob 
when they run. Owls have precise hearing for 
hunting rodents at night.

Some birds swim through icy Antarctic waters. 
Others fly through dense tropical rainforests. 
A few can soar over the Himalayan peaks.

From one end of the world to the other, birds 
thrive in the heat and cold. They live in jungles, 

deserts, and craggy coasts. These tiny 
modern dinosaurs are full of activity, finding 
food, building nests, and raising young.

The world of birds is vast and wonderful. Birds 
are fun and familiar, but also full of surprises. 
No matter if you’re a beginner or experienced 
birder, there’s always something new to learn. 
Ready to dive in?

This book is your introduction to the world of 
birds. Think of it as a little interactive museum. 
Explore its hallways in whatever order you like. 
Read about fun and fantastic birds. Try out 
some activities. Give birds realistic colors or 
grab your favorites and let your imagination 
run wild.

Now, put on your thinking caps, grab some art 
supplies, and fly to whatever page you like.
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